
BID TABULATION 

 

Montgomery College 
Procurement Office 

900 Hungerford Drive Suite 110 
Rockville, MD 20850 

www.montgomerycollege.edu/departments/procure 

BID # 515-016 ANATOMICAL MODELS 

 
Bid Opening Date/Time Purchasing Agent Recorded By 

APRIL 21, 2015@ 3:00PM Cherree Adams Lisa Dyer    
 

BIDDER      GROUP I                                  GROUP II 

 BIOMEDICAL MODELS $76,151.34 NO BID 

SARGENT-WELCH/VWR $83,595.14 $22,235.58 

GLOBAL TECHNOLOGY $79,955.00 $24,744.00 

PARCO SCIENTIFIC COMPANY $97,802.00 $19,746.00 

CAROLINA BIOLOGICAL SUPPLY $56,696.40 $28,182.60 

HOLT ANATOMICAL $81,083.00 $23,588.50 

AMERICAN DISTRIBUTIONS COMPANY $78,921.00 NO BID 

ANATOMICAL WORLDWIDE NO BID $22,668.77 

THERMO FISHER SCIENTIFIC $120,610.90 $21,288.70 

ARMSTRONG MEDICAL NO BID NO BID 

COSH HEALTHCARE NO BID NO BID 

   

   

   

   

   
NOTE: This Bid Tabulation is only a statement of pricing and does not reflect bid evaluation or award. 
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