BID TABULATION
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Montgomery College
Office of Procurement
900 Hungerford Drive, Suite 110
Rockville, MD 20850

www.montgomerycollege.edu/procure/

Bid No. 416-008

Insights Magazine

Bid Opening Date/Time

Purchasing Agent

Recorded By

July 31, 2015 at 3:30 PM Sena Wiles George Varghese
Bidder Fall Issue Spring Issue Annual Additional Pricing | Additional Copies AAs
Total Price Total Price Total Price 36 Pages/Issue 1,000 Increments Hourly Rate

32 Pages/Issue

Centaur Graphics LLC $40,066.00 $40,066.00 $80,132.00

New Market, Maryland

Stephenson Printing Inc. $45,045.40 $45,045.40 $90,090.80

Alexandria, Virginia

Westland Printers $51,995.00 $51,995.00 | $103,990.00

Laurel, Maryland

Goetz Printing Company $61,245.00 $61,245.00 | $122,490.00

Springfield, Virginia

Mount Royal Printing Company | $71,575.00 $71,575.00 | $143,150.00

Baltimore, Maryland

Uptown Press, Inc. $97,376.00 $97,376.00 | $194,752.00

Baltimore, Maryland
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Bidder Fall Issue Spring Issue Annual Additional Pricing | Additional Copies AAs
Total Price Total Price Total Price 36 Pages/Issue 1,000 Increments Hourly Rate
32 Pages/Issue
Graphic Visions No Bid
Gaithersburg, Maryland
HBP No Bid
Falls Church, Virginia
Peabody Press No Bid
Baltimore, Maryland
Printing Images No Bid
Rockville, Maryland
Washingtonian Media No Bid
Washington, DC
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