MC

MONTGOMERY
COLLEGE

RFB No.: 420-001

REQUEST FOR BID TABULATION

Montgomery College
Procurement Office
9221 Corporate Blvd., Rockville, MD 20850

montgomerycollege.edu/procure/

MULTI-FACILITY GROUND MAINTENANCE AND POND WEED CONTROL SERVICES

RFB Opening Date/Time

Purchasing Agent

Recorded By

February 28, 2020 at 3:00PM Yu Zhu Lisa Dyer
Bigyers Group 2 Group 3
Group 1
Group 2A Group 2B Group 3A Group 3B
Level Green Landscaping $5,512.00 $58,847.00 No Bid $24,468.00 | No Bid
Lake Source, LLC No Bid No Bid $5,670.00 No Bid $250.00
Scientific Plant Service $8,318.00 $85,993.00 $7,200.00 $53,024.00 |$10,051.00
Bright View Landscaping, LLC | $15,420.00 $186,983.00 $49,500.00 $63,919.00 | $8,600.00
Bry’s Lawn Care and $20,362.92 $71,119.00 $25,056.00 $35,630.00 $8,364.00
Landscaping, LLC
Landmark Lawns and $7,559.00 $104,314.00 | S$7,200.00 $53,024.00 | $10,051.00
Landscaping
Ruppert Landscape, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid $42,918.00 | $1,400.00
The Davey Tree Expert $5,988.05 $88,020.03 No Bid $35,925.72 | No Bid
Company




