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BID TABULATION 

 Office of Procurement 
 9221 Corporate Boulevard 
      Rockville, MD 20850 

 www.montgomerycollege.edu/procure 

RFB #420-004 Supplementary Snow Removal Services 

Bid Opening Date/Time Purchasing Agent Recorded By 

November 8, 2019 at 3:00 PM George Varghese Lis Dyer 

 BIDDERS 
Group 1 Unit Price (Regular Hours) Group 2 Unit Price (Regular Hours) 

Item 1 Item 2 Item 3 Item 4 Item 5 
Group 1 
TOTAL 

Item 1 Item 2 Item 3 
Group 2 
TOTAL 

AccuBid Civil  Constructions $189.00 $289.00 $149.00 $289.00 $149.00 $1,065.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

JLN Construction Services $300.00 $185.00 $160.00 $210.00 $65.00 $920.00 $140.00 $40.00 $40.00 $220.00 

SFMS Inc $140.00 $245.00 $125.00 No Bid $75.00 $145.00 $200.00 $40.00 $385.00 

Southlawn Towing and Recovery $150.00 $200.00 $150.00 $200.00 $200.00 $900.00 $125.00 $40.00 $40.00 $205.00 




