BID TABULATION

MC

MONTGOMERY
COLLEGE

RFB No.: e425-008

9221 Corporate Blvd., Rockville, MD 20850

Montgomery College

Office of Business Services

montgomerycollege.edu/procure

Multi-Facility Ground Maintenance and Pond Weed Control Services

RFB Opening Date/Time

Purchasing Agent

Recorded By

May 05, 2025 @3.00 PM

George Varghese

Da Conceicao Maria

Bidder Name

Landscapes LLC

Group Al Group A2 Group A3 Total: Group B1 | Group B2 Total:
(cT) (GT) (RV) A1+A2+A3= (GT) (RV) B1+B2 =
S S

LakeSource LLC No bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $8,100.00 | $7,200.00 | $15,300.00
Level Green $6,631.80 | $68,165.37 | $37,968.46 | $112,765.63 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Landscaping
Ez‘r;ega?;e Expert $12,110.00 | $118,936.00 | $47,600.00 | $178,646.00 | $32,400.00 | $10,800.00 | $43,200.00
Ruppert Landscape $9,637.85 | $181,193.86 | $45,537.85 | $236,369.56 | $12,342.96 | $6,814.26! | $19,157.22
BrightView $10,004.00 | $111,455.00 | $48,184.00 | $169,643.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid

! Price for 18 treatments
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