
 
 

 
 

BID TABULATION 
 

 

 
Montgomery College 

Office of Procurement  
9221 Corporate Blvd., Rockville, MD 20850 

montgomerycollege.edu/procure 
 

RFB No.: E426-002                                  CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES 
 

RFB Opening Date/Time Purchasing Agent Recorded By 

October 23, 2025 at 3:00PM George Varghese Maria Da Conceicao 
 

Bidder Name Group 1 Group 2 Group 3 Group 4 Group 5 
 Grand Total 

 Group 1-5 
McKesson Medical-Surgical Government 
Solutions LLC No bid No bid $22,250.51 $22,250.51 No bid 

 
$44,501.02 

Rudolph Office & Computer Supply, Inc $39,967.83 $110,096.55 $12,694.58 $12,694.58 $62,702.35 
  

$238,155.89 

W.W. Grainger, Inc. $51,812.15 $259,119.49 $15,192.22 $15,192.22 $43,326.35 
 $384,642.43 

Daycon Products Company, Inc. $ 41,605.34 $168,083.25 $ 13,994.21 $ 13,994.21 $ 57,801.86 
 $ 295,478.87 

S. Freedman & Sons, LLC $53,669.51 $186,942.97 $20,962.53 $18,525.69 $73,397.40 
  

$353,498.10 

Interboro Packaging Corporation No bid 
 

No bid 
 

No bid 
 

No bid 
 

No bid 
  

No bid 
 

Note: The bid tabulation is only a statement of bid pricing read aloud at the bid opening, and does not reflect bid evaluation or award. 
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